
  
Aromas of orange 

blossom and 
honeysuckle, with just 

a hint of spicy fresh 
ginger. Juicy white 

peach and nectarine fill 
the mouth and reveal 
hidden ripe pineapple 

and guava.  This bright 
fruity wine pairs very 
well with hard salty 

cheeses and relaxing on 
your favorite patio. 

Pinot Blanc-Viognier Pinot Blanc-Viognier Pinot Blanc-Viognier Pinot Blanc-Viognier
Aromas of orange 

blossom and 
honeysuckle, with just 

a hint of spicy fresh 
ginger. Juicy white 

peach and nectarine fill 
the mouth and reveal 
hidden ripe pineapple 

and guava.  This bright 
fruity wine pairs very 
well with hard salty 

cheeses and relaxing on 
your favorite patio. 

Aromas of orange 
blossom and 

honeysuckle, with just 
a hint of spicy fresh 
ginger. Juicy white 

peach and nectarine fill 
the mouth and reveal 
hidden ripe pineapple 

and guava.  This bright 
fruity wine pairs very 
well with hard salty 

cheeses and relaxing on 
your favorite patio. 

Aromas of orange 
blossom and 

honeysuckle, with just 
a hint of spicy fresh 
ginger. Juicy white 

peach and nectarine fill 
the mouth and reveal 
hidden ripe pineapple 

and guava.  This bright 
fruity wine pairs very 
well with hard salty 

cheeses and relaxing on 
your favorite patio. 

Aromas of orange 
blossom and 

honeysuckle, with just 
a hint of spicy fresh 
ginger. Juicy white 

peach and nectarine fill 
the mouth and reveal 
hidden ripe pineapple 

and guava.  This bright 
fruity wine pairs very 
well with hard salty 

cheeses and relaxing on 
your favorite patio. 

Pinot Blanc-Viognier
Aromas of orange 

blossom and 
honeysuckle, with just 

a hint of spicy fresh 
ginger. Juicy white 

peach and nectarine fill 
the mouth and reveal 
hidden ripe pineapple 

and guava.  This bright 
fruity wine pairs very 
well with hard salty 

cheeses and relaxing on 
your favorite patio. 

Pinot Blanc-Viognier
Aromas of orange 

blossom and 
honeysuckle, with just 

a hint of spicy fresh 
ginger. Juicy white 

peach and nectarine fill 
the mouth and reveal 
hidden ripe pineapple 

and guava.  This bright 
fruity wine pairs very 
well with hard salty 

cheeses and relaxing on 
your favorite patio. 

Pinot Blanc-Viognier
Aromas of orange 

blossom and 
honeysuckle, with just 

a hint of spicy fresh 
ginger. Juicy white 

peach and nectarine fill 
the mouth and reveal 
hidden ripe pineapple 

and guava.  This bright 
fruity wine pairs very 
well with hard salty 

cheeses and relaxing on 
your favorite patio. 

Pinot Blanc-Viognier


